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ALLIOT TECHNOLOGIES TO DISTRIBUTE MULTITECH GATEWAYS 

 
Leading IoT distributor, Alliot Technologies to bring industry-leading MultiTech 

gateway range to new customers in the UK & Ireland. 
 
Huddersfield, West Yorkshire, UK / July 29th 2020 – Specialist European IoT distributor, Alliot 
Technologies has today announced a new partnership with industry leaders, MultiTech. This new 
agreement sees Alliot expand its LoRaWAN® gateway range throughout the UK and Ireland. 
 
Commenting on their new official distributor status, Alliot’s Product Development Director, Paul 
Hayes said, “MultiTech are well renowned for their work within the LoRaWAN industry, we are 
incredibly excited to be working with such a well established brand.  
 
“As specialists in LoRaWAN technologies and edge-computing, the MultiTech LoRaWAN gateway 
range ticks all of the boxes. We hope that this addition to our portfolio will help to bring even more 
IoT projects to life.” 
 
“We look forward to working with Alliot to extend the reach of MultiTech products to new markets 
and use cases,” said Neil Carey, Regional Sales Director at MultiTech. “By adding Alliot to our 
distribution channel, we can better enable customers adopting the latest LPWA technologies with 
expanded local expertise.”  
 
END 
 
FOR MORE INFORMATION PLEASE CONTACT: 
Kate Millard | 01484 599544 | kate.millard@alliot.co.uk 
 
NOTES TO EDITOR: 
 
ABOUT ALLIOT TECHNOLOGIES: 

Alliot Technologies is Europe’s leading distributor of IoT products. Specialising in LoRaWAN, Alliot 
provides easy access to the best in class hardware, services and support to customers throughout 
the UK and Europe. Alliot’s vision is to simplify the set-up and ongoing management of IoT devices 
by providing solutions ready to be interfaced with the users’ selected IT structure through device 
provisioning services and support from an expert technical team.  

Alliot makes IoT accessible to all, helping partners to develop their solutions from proof of concept 
to fully scalable commercial solutions, enabling them to take all or just some of the specific 
components they need to bring their projects to life.  

For more information, contact Alliot Technologies at contact@alliot.co.uk or visit alliot.co.uk 

 
 
 
 



ABOUT MULTITECH: 
 
MultiTech designs, develops and manufactures communications equipment for the industrial 
internet of things – connecting physical assets to business processes to deliver enhanced value.  

From the earliest analog systems, to the cellular heart of today’s industrial Internet of Things to the 
latest low-power wireless technology and beyond, MultiTech has consistently connected 
businesses in ways previously unimaginable – and has been doing so for 50 years.  
 
Our commitment to quality and service excellence means you can count on MultiTech products and 
people to address your needs, while our history of innovation ensures you can stay ahead of the 
latest technology with a partner who will be there for the life of your solution. 

Visit www.multitech.com for more information 

FOR MORE INFORMATION: 
https://alliot.co.uk/ 
https://www.multitech.com/ 


